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RASPBERRY SEEDS AS A SOURCE OF ACTIVE COMPOUNDS FOR 
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Abstract 
 

The amount of fruits and vegetables losses in Republic of Serbia were over 150 000 t in 2020, 
according to FAOSTAT. United Nations Development Programme (UNDP) support 
innovative solutions that saves and renews natural resources and energy, prolongs the use of 
materials and products, and reduces waste. These solutions are of strategic importance and 
directly affect the protection of the environment. Seeds, peels, and pomace wasted in various 
stages of fruits processing are abundant in valuable components and considered as great 
source of antioxidants. Present research is designed to apply the principles of circular 
practices on green extraction procedures and characterization of natural active formulations 
from juice production industry waste. Starting raw material was raspberry seed, as source of 
ingredients with antioxidant and antimicrobial potential. Oils were extracted from seeds and 
the remaining cold-pressed cake was used for the extraction of polyphenols. Green extraction 
procedure was optimized by using several environmentally acceptable solvents and efficiency 
of applied eutectic mixtures were determined based on content of total polyphenols and 
antioxidant potential. Liquid and high-performance thin-layer chromatographies were used to 
estimate the contents of ellagic acid (free and total) and phenolic profile, respectively. Our 
goal is to encapsulate the obtained extracts, to ensure greater stability of active ingredients, 
their controlled and prolonged release, all in order to obtain technological solutions in food 
industry (e.g. edible coatings) and cosmetics. By protecting resources and the environment, 
our non-linear study is designed to promote the take-make-dispose-recycle approach and it is 
financially supported by the UNDP Serbia (2023). 
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